
Administrators play a critical role in facilitating
the overall operations of WeReachOut and
serve as primary contacts for sponsors to keep
them informed about ongoing activities.

They are responsible for managing
sponsorships across different functional areas
within WeReachOut.

They regularly convene in forums to review
progress, share insights, and plan further
activities that align with WeReachOut's
mission.

Sponsors

About WeReachOut
WeReachOut is a volunteer-based 501(C)(3)
non-profit organization without any religious
or political affiliation. We are committed to
making a difference by connecting sponsors
with students across India who are in need of
support since 2004.

Our Beliefs
We believe that every student with the desire
and determination to succeed in life deserves
an opportunity to excel, regardless of their
background and financial circumstances.

We believe that both financial support and
career guidance are essential in helping
students achieve their full potential.

We also believe sponsors are best positioned
to select deserving students through their
contacts in India as beneficiaries of their
sponsorship, recognizing the lasting positive
impact on their lives, families, and society.

Our Services
We manage all sponsorship details, from
collecting student details to distributing funds
and monitoring progress. Sponsors receive
regular updates via email and our website.

We help students gain essential skills through
career guidance and encourage them to get
involved in community services to promote
social responsibility.

Our services are free, and we ensure that 100%
of sponsors' contributions go directly to
students' education, with no deductions for
operating costs.

Mentors
Mentors serve as the primary contact for
WeReachOut students, overseeing local
coordination and mentoring to enhance their
academic achievements.

These individuals may include our former
students, career guidance professionals, or
social workers who assist WeReachOut in
organizing career and personality
development programs for students in their
location.

They also encourage students to engage in
social service-oriented activities, guiding them
to recognize their capabilities and potential to
make a difference in our society.

Administrators

Students
"Today's Students are Tomorrow's Leaders"

The world needs true leaders to ensure
fairness for everyone. At WeReachOut.org, we
are committed to instilling these values in our
students through our services.

WeReachOut enables sponsors like you to
support and inspire them in becoming
impactful leaders in our society.

Our Model
This diagram depicts our model of operations

Sponsors play a crucial role in WeReachOut by:

1) Identifying students in need from their
neighborhoods, local contacts, schools, or
communities in India for sponsorship.

2) Making monetary contributions to cover the
educational expenses of the students they
have identified.

3) Assisting WeReachOut in finding mentors
from their region who can support and guide
sponsored students.

Sponsors can also assist by sharing their
sponsorship experience with WeReachOut and
its positive impact on students' lives to reach
more deserving students across various parts
of India.
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Empowering Future Leaders

Sponsorship Process by Role How Can I Help?
1) Sponsor a Student:  Start by submitting the
contact details of the student you wish to
sponsor or select a student from the Students-
In-Need section on our website based on your
preference.

2) Become a Volunteer: Help organize
WeReachOut promotional events, raise
awareness about our outreach program, and
help us reach out to more students in need
from different parts of India.

3) Subscribe to our Newsletter: Stay updated
and help spread the word about WeReachOut
through your social networks and encourage
others to sponsor students from their
neighborhood.

Contact Us

WEREACHOUT
P.O. BOX 718,

TRACY, CA - 95376

+1 408 657 8181
info@wereachout.org
www.wereachout.org

A platform to empower
deserving students through

personalized giving 
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Sponsors
Sponsors submit the contact details of
students they wish to support, ensuring direct
engagement in the sponsorship process.

WeReachOut also assists sponsors in selecting
students through our curated list of Students-
In-Need on our website.

Our website allows sponsors to track their
donations, sponsorship distributions, current
balance, and students’ progress by year.

Students
Students complete the Student Detail form,
providing necessary information including their
bank account details, to ensure smooth
processing of sponsorships.

Upon receiving sponsorship funds, students will
send an acknowledgment letter to confirm
receipt of the sponsorship.

Students are encouraged to submit their
updates to WeReachOut, ensuring that
sponsors stay informed about their progress
and achievements.

Administrators
Administrators guide students through
completing the Student Detail form, including
bank account details to ensure seamless
sponsorship distribution.

Upon reviewing the completed form,
administrators activate the student record on
our website to link them with their sponsors.

Administrators also collect & upload scanned
copies of students' reports and receipts to
make them available to their sponsors.
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